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delinitive manual of practice, in lhct Sut-
clilt'e has produced something dillbrent-
a discourse, an essay on the state of the

usual, addition to the field.
With the exception of the important

and regular outpul ol'the two peribdicals
of the Visual R6sources Association, Vis-
ual Resources, an Intem,ational Jou,mal of
Docum"entation and, VRA Bulletin. the
slide librarians' prol'essional bookshell'de-
mands little space. The literature of slide
collection management is, as Sutcliffe
notes, "incomplete and liagmented" (p.
34). (Throueliout this reviJw I use the
terms "slideiollection management" and
"slide librarianship" interchangeably. The
Iirrmer and more inclusive term covers
the literature of slide manaqement re-
gardless o l' prol'essional trainir€). That lit-
erature, in addition to f'allinp outside o{'
mainstream librarianship, is largely out of'
date, predating image databises, net-
worked images, and the WorldWide Web.

There are .just thirty-two monographs
with the subject heading "Libr;ie:s-

Special collections-Slides" in the OCLC
Online Computer Library Center Inc.'s
FirstSearch database. Ranging in date
from 1967 to 1995, these monographs in-
clude second editions and duplicaie rec-
ords, and consist primarily of how-to
manuals and spiral-bound pamphlets, all
based on first-hand experience or surveys
ot practice.

Slide librarians are generally aware
years in advance offorthcoming books in
their field. Betty Jo lrvine'.s standard text,
Slide Libraries, galvanized the commu-
nity of academic slide librarians and slide
curators duringthe late 1960s, and Nancy
Schuller's lengthy manual, Management

forYisaal Resources Collections, was long
awaited in the mid-1980s.

Sutcli{I'e's book comes to us from a very
difl'erent imr)etus. Sutclitl'e is the audio-
visual librarian at the Learning Resources
Center, Calderdale College, Halif'ax,
U.K., where the neqlected slide sets and
slide/tape programs-led him to concen-

sity of Wales, 1989). Sutclill'es goal is to
make a "coordinating contribution in a
{ragmented area of infbrmation work

arts and medical illustration communities.
finding little published literature on prac-
tices in public hbraries, museums, and
photographic rights and reproduction
houses. He looks at the field with a broad
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perspective and a critical eye, and in-

.lrd"r the "true" slide library smaller and

less-structured slide collections, as well as

slide sets and slide/tape programs in me-

dia centers.

both f'ascinatinq and uneven. Where Sut-

cli{I'e succeeds admirably is in his place-

ment of a multitude of f'actors in a histori-

cal context, bringing these into the

Dresent, and making tliem intelligible and

interesting. This is tiue even when he goes

too f'ar in"one direction or not enough in

another: {br instance, his full discussion of

visual orientation contrasts with the brev-

packaging ot'slide sets to look like books,

and th"e ,r"alue of the "unitary" slide lihrary

over slide/tape programs and slide sets'

In a pure sense the true slide library is that

which has been referred to by one primary

source as made up of "unitary images"'

This distinction is important since '

whereas the tape/slide sequence and the

slide set can be success{ully integrated in

conventional library shelvirrg arrange-

ments the collection of single images by its

very nature requires segregated treat-
ment Clearly, almost any body of slides

can be grouped into subsections to form

sets in fixed sequences and it is a crucial

management decision to choose to do this

or to make the basic unit of the collection

the single image. This has a lundamental

e{Iect on the amount of processing work

which is required in identiiying, labeling,

classi{ying, cataloguing and indexing

There is no escape liom the lact that the

collection of unitary images reqtrires con-

siderably more labour to establish, admin-

ister and maintain than does a collection of

slide sets, but it is also inescapable that

such work is an absolute necessity to {'ul{ill

the soecilic needs that such a collection is

consiructed to meet (P. 26).

In his second chapter, "The Literature

of Slide Collection Management," he ex-

amines the literature {rom several &{I'er-

ent historical Perspectives. Discussing is-

sues such as the marginalization of slide

librarians and divisions within the {ield

itself between slide librarians and slide

curators (pro{'essional managers not

trained a.s liLrarians), Sutclill'e'.s long Brit-

ish sentences read almost as asides, but

are rieht on mark.

LJterly a conscious shilt in library educa-

tion has been made away liom the concept

of the librarian being a book manager to-

wards being an infbrmalion manager' This

has been rellected strongly in the content

of degree courses ofl'ered and has ex-

tended to the renaming of university de-

illustrations, in image databases fbr exam-

ple, is likely to con{irm and consolidate this'

it was not until the late 1980s though, that

this trend reached an openly and {u}ly ar:-

1983, 1983-1989, and 1989 to date.



Sutclifl'e also positions the literature in
tenns of the debates over pro{'essional
training, -acknowledging the strengths that
both slide librarians ind slide 

"curators

have brought to the lield, and the imnact
that this division has had on the literat'ure.

However, other chapters are less suc_
cessful, such as "The Tlchnic.al prepara-
tion of Slides as Stock ltems" and'.Com-
mercially Available Slide Management
and - Retrieval packages." His Jhapter
"Slide Retrieval" {all.s somewhe.e 

^b"-

tween the-practical and the analytical,
with an awkward result. Here he tickles
the still contentious debate over whether
to classify or not, curiously but sensibly
combining it with a prosaii. discussion oi'
slide storage systems.

Sutcli{Ie admits to seeing some value
in adapting book classilication schemes
{br slides, at lirst a shocking con{'ession.
However, his view makes moie sense alter
reading the chapter on "Medical Slide
Collections," where the practice is com-
mon. (It is not common in.art and archi-
tecture collections in the United States.)

chapter "Optical Disc Systems and the
slid;."

Sutclifl'e'.s book would have benefited
by any one o{'several {'actors. His descrip-
tion oI'slide storage systems is one of the
areas in which British practice di{I'ers
{rom American, and the sa-me is true in the
areas ofcopyright and prel'erence lbr ana-
log technology. These could have been
c'ompared explicitly and more fully. In-
cleed, comparison oI'Briti.sh and American

cess image database software, are serrous
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omissions. Footnoting could have been
more specific, pointing more often to ex-
act pages or authors. As a state-o{-therart
review, either an annotated bibliography
or a classilied bibliography woultl hav!
been more use{ul than one l6ng alphabeti-
cal listing. Nevertheless, the"bobk con-
tains a wealth of'factual infbrmation not
readily lbund elsewhere, and it achieved
its goals. It made fbr productive, stimulat-
ing, and provocative reading, and makes a
valuable contribution to the literature of
the lield.-Bq Murylq Snow, Architecture
Slide Library, IJnh:Lrsitg of Culifomia,
Berkeley.
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